resistance-rated floor-ceiling and wall assemblies shall extend to and be tight
against the exterior wall, and wall assemblies shall extend to the underside of the
roof sheathing.
Exceptions:
1. A fire-resistance rating of one-half (1/2) hour shall be permitted in
buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with NFPA 13.
2. Wall assemblies need not extend through attic spaces when the ceiling
is protected by not less than five-eighths-inch (15.9 mm) Type' X gypsum
board and an attic draft stop constructed as specified in Section R502.12.1
is provided above and along the wall assembly separating the dwellings.
The structural framing supporting the ceiling shall also be protected by not
less than one-half-inch (12.7 mm) gypsum board or equivalent.
R313.1.1 Supporting construction. When floor assemblies are required to be
fire-resistance-rated by Section R313.1, the supporting construction of such
assemblies shall have an equal or greater fire-resistive rating.
R313.2 Townhouses. Each townhouse shall be considered a separate building and
shall be separated by fire — resistance-rated wall assemblies meeting the
requirements of Section R302 for exterior walls.
Exception: A common two-hour fire-resistance-rated wall is permitted for
townhouses if such walls do not contain plumbing or mechanical
equipment, ducts or vents in the cavity of the common wall. Electrical
installations shall be installed in accordance with Chapters 34 through 43.
Penetrations of electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with Section
R313.3.
R313.2.1 Continuity. The fire-resistance-rated wall or assembly separating
townhouses shall be continuous from the foundation to the underside of the roof
sheathing, deck or slab. The fire-resistance rating shall extend the full length of
the wall or assembly, including wall extensions through and separating attached
enclosed accessory structures.
R313.2.2 Parapets. Parapets constructed in accordance with Section R313.2.3
shall be constructed for townhouses as an extension of exterior walls or common
walls in accordance with the following:
1. Where roof surfaces adjacent to the wall or walls are at the same
elevation, the parapet shall extend not less than thirty (30) inches (762
mm) above the roof surfaces.
2.Where roof surfaces adjacent to the wall or walls are at different
elevations and the higher roof is not more than thirty (30) inches (762



mm) above the lower roof, the parapet shall extend not less than thirty (30)
inches (762 mm) above the lower roof surface
Exception: A parapet is not required in the two (2) cases above when the
roof is covered with a minimum Class C roof covering, and the roof
decking or sheathing is of noncombustible materials or approved fire-
retardant-treated wood for a distance of four (4) feet (1,219 mm) on each
side of the wall or walls, or one (1) layer of five-eighths-inch (15.9 mm)
Type X gypsum board is installed directly beneath the roof decking or
sheathing, supported by a minimum of nominal two-inch (51 mm) ledgers
attached to the sides of the roof framing members, for a minimum distance
of four (4) feet (1,220 mm) on each side of the wall or walls. A parapet is
not required where roof surfaces adjacent to the wall or walls are at
different elevations and the higher roof is more than thirty (30) inches
(762 mm) above the lower roof. The common wall construction from the
lower roof to the underside of the higher roof deck shall have not less than
a one-hour fire-resistance rating. The wall shall be rated for exposure from
both sides.
R313.2.3 Parapet construction. Parapets shall have the same fire-resistance
rating as that required for the supporting wall or walls. On any side adjacent to a
roof surface, the parapet shall have noncombustible faces for the uppermost
eighteen (18) inches (457 mm), to include counter flashing and coping materials.
Where the roof slopes toward a parapet at slopes greater than two (2) units
vertical in twelve (12) units horizontal (16.7% slope), the parapet shall extend to
the same height as any portion of the roof within a distance of three (3) feet (914
mm), but in no case shall the height be less than thirty (30) inches (762 mm).
R313.2.4 Structural independence. Each individual townhouse shall be
structurally independent.
Exceptions:
1. Foundations supporting exterior walls or common walls.
2. Structural roof and wall sheathing from each unit may fasten to the
common wall framing.
3. Nonstructural wall coverings.
4. Flashing at termination of roof covering over common wall.
5. Townhouses separated by a common two-hour fire-resistance-rated wall
as provided in Section R317.2
g. Section E3902.10, Kitchen Dishwasher branch circuit, is hereby amended by
deleting Section E3902.10 in its entirety.
h. Section E3902.16, Arc-Fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection, is hereby
amended by deleting Section E3902.16 in its entirety.



i. Section E3902.17, Arc-Fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection for branch
circuit extensions or modifications, is hereby amended by deleting Section
E3902.17 in its entirety.
2. Manufactured Housing Code Adopted. The manufactured housing code of the City of
Ste. Genevieve shall consist of the ICC International Residential Code, 2018 Edition,
Appendix E, Manufactured Housing Used As Dwellings, published by the International
Code Council, Inc., (the “Manufactured Housing Code™) which is incorporated herein by
reference and made a part hereof.
a. Amendments to the Manufactured Housing Code. The Manufactured Housing
Code is hereby amended as follows:
(1) Section AE101. 1 General is hereby amended by deleting Section
AE101.1 in its entirety and adopting a new Section AE101.1 to read as
follows:
Section AE101.1 These provisions shall be applicable only to a
manufactured home used as a single dwelling unit and shall apply to the
following:
(a) Construction, alteration and repair of any foundation system
which is necessary to provide for the installation of a manufactured
home unit.
(b) Construction, installation, addition, alteration, repair or
maintenance of the building service equipment which is necessary
for connecting manufactured homes to water, fuel, or power
supplied and sewage systems.
(¢) Alterations, additions or repairs to existing manufactured
homes. The construction, alteration, moving, demolition, repair
and use of accessory buildings and structures, and their building
service equipment, shall comply with the requirements of the codes
adopted by this jurisdiction.
These provisions shall not be applicable to the design and
construction of manufactured homes and shall not be deemed to
authorize either modifications or additions to manufactured homes
where otherwise prohibited.
(2) Section AES02.2, Soil classification, is hereby amended by deleting
Section AE502.2 in its entirety.
3. Tiny House Code Adopted. The tiny house code of the City of Ste. Genevieve shall
consist of the ICC International Residential Code, 2018 Edition, Appendix Q, Tiny
Houses, published by the International Code Council, Inc., (the “Tiny House Code™)
which is incorporated herein by reference and made a part hereof.



C. International Plumbing Code Adopted. The plumbing code of the City of Ste. Genevieve shall
consist of the ICC International Plumbing Code, 2018 Edition, published by the International
Code Council, Inc. (the "Plumbing Code") which is incorporated herein by reference and made a
part hereof.
1. Amendments to the International Plumbing Code. The Plumbing Code is hereby
amended as follows:
a. Section 101.1, Title, is hereby amended by substituting "City of Ste.
Genevieve" for the words "[NAME OF JURISDICTION]."
b. Section 104.4, Right of Entry, is hereby repealed in its entirety
¢. Section 109, Means of Appeal, is hereby amended by deleting Section 109.1
through 109.7 and adopting a new Section 109.1 to read as follows:
109.1 Board of Appeals. To hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the Building Official relating to the application and
interpretation of this code, the Board of Adjustment of the City shall sit as the
Board of Appeals having the authority set forth in this code and shall adopt rules
of procedure for the conduct of such appeals in accordance with applicable law.
Any person directly impacted by an action or decision of the code official such
that the person would have standing in a court of law to challenge the action may
petition the Board of Adjustment for a review of any final decision of any City
officer under the Building Code, provided that a written application for appeal is
filed within thirty (30) business days after the day of the decision or order served.
An application for appeal shall be based solely on a claim that:
(1) The true intent of the code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been
incorrectly interpreted;
(2) The provisions of this code do not fully apply; or
(3) The requirements of the code are adequately satisfied by other means.
The Board of Adjustment shall have no authority to waive the
requirements of this code. The decision of the Board of Adjustment may
be further appealed to the Circuit Court of Ste. Genevieve County as
provided in Section 67.430, RSMo.

D. International Mechanical Code Adopted. The mechanical code of the City of Ste. Genevieve
shall consist of the ICC International Mechanical Code, 2018 Edition, published by the
International Code Council, Inc. (the "Mechanical Code") which is incorporated by reference and
made a part thereof.
1. Amendments to the International Mechanical Code. The Mechanical Code is hereby
amended as follows:
a. Section 101.1, Title, is hereby amended by substituting "City of Ste.
Genevieve" for the words "[NAME OF JURISDICTION]."



b. Section 104.4, Right of Entry, is hereby repealed in its entirety.
¢. Section 109, Means of Appeal, is hereby amended by deleting Section 109.1
through 109.7 and adopting a new Section 109.1 to read as follows:
109.1 Board of Appeals. To hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or
determination made by the Building Official relating to the application and
interpretation of this code, the Board of Adjustment of the City shall sit as the
Board of Appeals having the authority set forth in this code and shall adopt rules
of procedure for the conduct of such appeals in accordance with applicable law.
Any person directly impacted by an action or decision of the code official such
that the person would have standing in a court of law to challenge the action may
petition the Board of Adjustment for a review of any final decision of any City
officer under the Building Code, provided that a written application for appeal is
filed within thirty (30) business days after the day of the decision or order served.
An application for appeal shall be based solely on a claim that:
(1) The true intent of the code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been
incorrectly interpreted,;
(2) The provisions of this code do not fully apply; or
(3) The requirements of the code are adequately satisfied by other means.
The Board of Adjustment shall have no authority to waive the
requirements of this code. The decision of the Board of Adjustment may
be further appealed to the Circuit Court of Ste. Genevieve County as
provided in Section 67.430, RSMo.

E. International Fire Code Adopted. The fire code of the City of Ste. Genevieve shall consist of
the ICC International Fire Code, 2018 Edition, published by the International Code Council, Inc.
(the "Fire Code") which is incorporated herein by reference and made part thereof.
1. Amendments to the International Fire Code. The Fire Code is hereby amended as
follows:
a. Section 101.1, Title, is hereby amended by substituting "City of Ste.
Genevieve" for the words "[NAME OF JURISDICTION]."
b. Sections 104.3, Right of Entry, is hereby repealed in its entirety.
c. Section 109, Board of Appeals, is hereby amended by deleting Section 109.1
through 109.3 and adopting a new Section R109.1 to read as follows:
109.1 Board of Appeals. To hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the Building Official relating to the application and
interpretation of this code, the Board of Adjustment of the City shall sit as the
Board of Appeals having the authority set forth in this code and shall adopt rules
of procedure for the conduct of such appeals in accordance with applicable law.
Any person directly impacted by an action or decision of the code official such



that the person would have standing in a court of law to challenge the action may
petition the Board of Adjustment for a review of any final decision of any City
officer under the Building Code, provided that a written application for appeal is
filed within thirty (30) business days after the day of the decision or order served.
An application for appeal shall be based solely on a claim that:
(1) The true intent of the code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been
incorrectly interpreted;
(2) The provisions of this code do not fully apply; or
(3) The requirements of the code are adequately satisfied by other means.
The Board of Adjustment shall have no authority to waive the
requirements of this code. The decision of the Board of Adjustment may
be further appealed to the Circuit Court of Ste. Genevieve County as
provided in Section 67.430, RSMo.
d. Section 506, Key Boxes, is hereby amended by deleting Section 506 in its
entirety and adopting a new section 506 to read as follows:
506.1 Where required. The following structures shall be equipped with a Knox
Box at or near the main entrance or such other location required by the Fire Chief:
(A) Commercial or industrial structures that are secured in a manner that
restricts access during an emergency.
(B) Multi-family residential structures that have a common corridor for
access to living units to which access is restricted through locked doors.
(C) Governmental structures and group residential facilities.
All newly constructed structures identified in Section 506.1(A)-(C) shall have the
Knox Box installed and operational prior to the issuance of an occupancy permit.
All substantially renovated structures identified in Section 506.1(A)-(C) shall
have the Knox Box installed and operational prior to the issuance of a final
inspection.
All existing structures identified in Section 506.1(A)-(C) that change ownership
or occupancy shall have the Knox Box installed and operational prior to the
issuance of an occupancy permit.
Exception: The City Administrator or his/her designee shall be authorized
to approve waiver of this requirement upon receipt of such request for
good reason from the owner of a structure.
506.2 Type, The Fire Chief shall designate the type of Knox Box system to be
implemented within the City and shall have the authority to require all structures
to use the designated system.
506.3 Responsibility, The owner or operator of a structure required to have a
Knox Box shall at all times keep a key in the lock box that will allow for access to
the structure. The owner or operator of the building shall immediately notify the



Fire Chief and provide the new key where a lock is changed or rekeyed. The key
to such lock shall be secured in the key box. The Fire Chief shall be authorized to
implement rules and regulations for the use of the Knox Box system.

F. International Property Maintenance Code Adopted. The property maintenance code of the
City of Ste. Genevieve shall consist of the [CC International Property Maintenance Code, 2018
Edition, published by the International Code Council, Inc. (the "Property Maintenance Code")
which is incorporated herein by reference and made a part hereof.
1. Amendments to the International Property Maintenance Code. The Property
Maintenance Code is hereby amended as follows:
a. Section 101.1, Title, is hereby amended by substituting "City of Ste.
Genevieve" for the words "[NAME OF JURISDICTION]."
b. Section 104.3, Right of Entry, is hereby repealed in its entirety.
c. Section 111, Means of Appeal, is hereby amended by deleting Section 111.1
through 111.8 and adopting a new Section 111.1 to read as follows:
111.1 Board of Appeals. To hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the Building Official relating to the application and
interpretation of this code, the Board of Adjustment of the City shall sit as the
Board of Appeals having the authority set forth in this code and shall adopt rules
of procedure for the conduct of such appeals in accordance with applicable law.
Any person directly impacted by an action or decision of the code official such
that the person would have standing in a court of law to challenge the action may
petition the Board of Adjustment for a review of any final decision of any City
officer under the Building Code, provided that a written application for appeal is
filed within thirty (30) business days after the day of the decision or order served.
An application for appeal shall be based solely on a claim that:
(1) The true intent of the code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have
been incorrectly interpreted;
(2) The provisions of this code do not fully apply; or
(3) The requirements of the code are adequately satisfied by other means.
The Board of Adjustment shall have no authority to waive the
requirements of this code. The decision of the Board of
Adjustment may be further appealed to the Circuit Court of Ste.
Genevieve County as provided in Section 67.430, RSMo.
d. Section 602.3, Heat Supply, is hereby amended to insert dates of October 1 to
April 1 for heat.
e. Section 602.4, Occupiable Work Spaces, is hereby amended to insert dates of
October 1 to April 1 for heat.



f. Section 603, Mechanical Equipment, is hereby amended to include the
following additional sections:

603.7 Shut-off Valves. Lines serving gas-operated mechanical equipment shall be
fitted with a shut-off valve; shut-off valves shall be located within six (6) feet of
the appliance.

603.8. Carbon Monoxide Alarms. An approved carbon monoxide alarm shall be
installed outside of each separate sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of the
bedrooms in dwellings units in which fuel-fired appliances are installed and in
dwellings units that have attached garages. Where multiple carbon monoxide
alarms are required, they must be interconnected.

g. Section 605.2, Receptacles, is hereby amended by deleting Section 605.2 in its
entirety and adopting a new Section 605.2 to read as follows:

605.2 Receptacles. Every habitable space in a dwelling shall contain at least two
(2) separate and remote receptacle outlets. All receptacles listed in Section
210.8(A) of NEC 2020 shall be provided with ground fault circuit interrupter
protection. All receptacle outlets shall have the appropriate faceplate cover for the
location.

G. National Electric Code Adopted. The electrical code of the City of Ste. Genevieve shall
consist of the NFPA 70 National Electrical Code, 2020 Edition, published by the National Fire
Protection Association, ("Electrical Code™) which is incorporated herein by reference and made a
part hereof.
1. Amendments to the National Electrical Code. The Electrical Code is hereby amended
as follows:
a. Article 90, Introduction, is hereby amended by adding Section 90.10 Board of
Appeals as follows:
Section 90.10 Board of Appeals. To hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions
or determinations made by the Building Official relating to the application and
interpretation of this code, the Board of Adjustment of the City shall sit as the
Board of Appeals having the authority set forth in this code and shall adopt rules
of procedure for the conduct of such appeals in accordance with applicable law.
Any person directly impacted by an action or decision of the code official such
that the person would have standing in a court of law to challenge the action may
petition the Board of Adjustment for a review of any final decision of any City
officer under the Building Code, provided that a written application for appeal is
filed within thirty (30) business days after the day of the decision or order served.
An application for appeal shall be based solely on a claim that:
(1) The true intent of the code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been
incorrectly interpreted;



(2) The provisions of this code do not fully apply; or

(3) The requirements of the code are adequately satisfied by other means.
The Board of Adjustment shall have no authority to waive the
requirements of this code. The decision of the Board of Adjustment may
be further appealed to the Circuit Court of Ste. Genevieve County as
provided in Section 67.430, RSMo.

b. Section 210.12, Arc-Fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection, is hereby

amended by deleting Section 210.12 in its entirety.

c. Section 406.4(D)(4) Arc-Fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection, is hereby

amended by deleting Section 406.4(D)(4) in its entirety.

d. Section 422.5 (A) General, is hereby amended by deleting sub-section (7)

Dishwashers.

H. International Fuel Gas Code Adopted. The fuel gas code of the City of Ste. Genevieve shall
consist of the ICC International Fuel Gas Code, 2018 Edition, published by the International
Code Council, Inc., (the "Fuel Gas Code") which is incorporated herein by reference and made

part thereof.

1. Amendments to the International Fuel Gas Code. The Fuel Gas Code is hereby
amended as follows:

a. Section 101.1, Title, is hereby amended by substituting "City of Ste.
Genevieve" for the words "[NAME OF JURISDICTION}."

b. Section 104.4, Right of Entry, is hereby repealed in its entirety.

c. Section 109, Means of Appeal, is hereby amended by deleting Section 109.1
through 109.7 and adopting a new Section 109 to read as follows:

109.1 Board of Appeals. To hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the Building Official relating to the application and
interpretation of this code, the Board of Adjustment of the City shall sit as the
Board of Appeals having the authority set forth in this code and shall adopt rules
of procedure for the conduct of such appeals in accordance with applicable law.
Any person directly impacted by an action or decision of the code official such
that the person would have standing in a court of law to challenge the action may
petition the Board of Adjustment for a review of any final decision of any City
officer under the Building Code, provided that a written application for appeal is
filed within thirty (30) business days after the day of the decision or order served.
An application for appeal shall be based solely on a claim that:

(1) The true intent of the code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been
incorrectly interpreted,

(2) The provisions of this code do not fully apply; or

(3) The requirements of the code are adequately satisfied by other means.



The Board of Adjustment shall have no authority to waive the
requirements of this code. The decision of the Board of Adjustment may
be further appealed to the Circuit Court of Ste. Genevieve County as
provided in Section 67.430, RSMo.

1. International Existing Building Code Adopted. The existing building code of the City of Ste.
Genevieve shall consist of the ICC International Existing Building Code, 2018 Edition,
published by the International Code Council, Inc. (the "Existing Building Code") which is
incorporated herein by reference and made a part hereof.
1. Amendments to the International Existing Building Code. The Existing Building Code
is hereby amended as follows:
a. Section 101.1, Title, is hereby amended by substituting "City of Ste.
Genevieve" for the words "[NAME OF JURISDICTION]."
b. Section 104.6, Right of Entry, is hereby repealed in its entirety.
c. Section 112 Board of Appeals is hereby amended by deleting Section 112.1
through 112.3 and adopting a new Section 112 to read as follows:
112.1 Board of Appeals. To hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the Building Official relating to the application and
interpretation of this code, the Board of Adjustment of the City shall sit as the
Board of Appeals having the authority set forth in this code and shall adopt rules
of procedure for the conduct of such appeals in accordance with applicable law.
Any person directly impacted by an action or decision of the code official such
that the person would have standing in a court of law to challenge the action may
petition the Board of Adjustment for a review of any final decision of any City
officer under the Building Code, provided that a written application for appeal is
filed within thirty (30) business days after the day of the decision or order served.
An application for appeal shall be based solely on a claim that:
(1) The true intent of the code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been
incorrectly interpreted;
(2) The provisions of this code do not fully apply; or
(3) The requirements of the code are adequately satisfied by other means.
The Board of Adjustment shall have no authority to waive the
requirements of this code. The decision of the Board of Adjustment may
be further appealed to the Circuit Court of Ste. Genevieve County as
provided in Section 67.430, RSMo.



610T-51-C

0 -] EAEGE) = 0 0 0
s§ 008 AL N 8 HI o€ S 0-a N N N SII 0z
@ ydap ®
Oanay | Oxaant | @) () QEAINOAA | ) dNAL| (3 oyvvisor | oury ® | wonaLyo| @ 2u0z S| (Juodar | () sage | (wdw) |(0) @VOT
TVIANNY | ONIZIHIA | S VZVH | INAWAV RIZANN | NOISAd ' ysoag |SUMOWRIM T o cq | MM pu peroads | orydeiZodoy | (ppaads| MONS
NVIN dAV | AOOH | WRNVEADI | JIINIM INSTLS aNnouo
WOUd ADVINVA OL LOArdNs NOISH@ ANTA

eusju9 ubiseq d1ydesBoan pue snewntd (1)z'10cY alqeL

9A3IABUDY) 9)S JO AJ1D

1 Jusuiyoeny 00s

SNOILVYINO3Y ONIATING ANV SONIaTing




SECTION 2. This Ordinance shall be codified.

SECTION 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its date of passage
and approval.

DATE OF FIRST READING: FEBRUARY 10. 2022

DATE OF SECOND READING:

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS DAY OF , 20 BY A
ROLL CALL VOTE OF THE STE. GENEVIEVE BOARD OF ALDERMEN AS
FOLLOWS:

VOTE

ALDERMAN GARY SMITH
ALDERWOMAN SUSAN JOHNSON
ALDERMAN BOB DONOVAN
ALDERMAN MIKE JOKERST
ALDERMAN JEFF EYDMANN
ALDERMAN MIKE RANEY
ALDERWOMAN ASHLEY ARMBRUSTER
ALDERMAN JOSEPH PRINCE

Yes No Absent

Approved as to form:

Paul Hassler, Mayor Mark Bishop, City Attorney

SEAL Reviewed by:

Pam Meyer, City Clerk Happy Welch, City Administrator



BILL NO. 4474 ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE ADDING TO SECTION 500.100 DEFINITIONS OF CHAPTER 500
BUILDING CODES OF THE STE. GENEVIEVE CODE OF ORDINANCES.

WHEREAS, with the planned update to the 2018 International Building Codes; and

WHEREAS, one of the new sections requires defining what is Economically Feasible so it can
be interpreted correctly; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Aldermen consider this definition addition important and necessary to
Section 500 of the Municipal Code of Ordinances.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN OF THE
CITY OF STE. GENEVIEVE, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1.  The following shall be added to Section 500.100 Definitions:

ECONOMICALLY FEASIBLE - As referenced in this section, an additional cost of not more
than 20% of the cost of the base project.

SECTION 2. This ordinance shall be codified.

SECTION 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its date of passage
and approval.

DATE OF FIRST READING: FEBRUARY 10, 2022
DATE OF SECOND READING:
PASSED AND APPROVED THIS __ DAY OF » 2022 BY A ROLL

CALL VOTE OF THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN AS FOLLOWS:

Alderman Gary Smith
Alderwoman Susan Johnson
Alderman Bob Donovan
Alderman Mike Jokerst
Alderman Jeff Eydmann
Alderman Mike Raney
Alderwoman Ashley Armbruster
Alderman Joe Prince

T 8

____Ayes Nays Absent




Approved as to form:

Paul Hassler, Mayor Mark Bishop, City Attorney

ATTEST: Reviewed by:

Pam Meyer, City Clerk Happy Welch, City Administrator



Staff Report 6&? - o
iy AR . <
February 24, 2022 .
1 Genevicve

ot
To:  Board of Aldermen St i = 1ssoun
From: Happy Welch

Re:  Parkwood Concrete Replacement

Issue:

Bid requests were sent out to 4 concrete contractors with 4 responses for the bid opening on
Thursday, February 10, 2022. Those submitting bids were Jokerst Paving, Lappe Cement
Finishing, Fronabarger Concreters, and CE Contracting. Bids were advertised in the January 5
edition of The Herald. We also walked the site with the contractors.

Bids were opened and read aloud at 11a. This bid included an Add Alternate due to differences
in the type of concrete that would need to be used due to the heavy volume of traffic at the
intersection of Parkwood and Point Basse. An amount was also included showing the cost of
replacing bad subgrade.

Recommendation:

Low bid based on the Parkwood replacement section is CE Contracting at $143,054.40 and
including the add alternate of $23,228 is also CE Contracting at $166,282.40. However, the
amount budgeted using ARPA funds is $150,000 which is not enough to include the Add
Alternate with those funds.



00'000°0ST S 1unowy pajespng

188pNq 3Y1 SPIIING PAPN[ILL FNELISIY PPY UL X 00°0TT S Ov'Z8T'99T $ 00'8ZTET $ OFPSO'ERT S 0L9E9 'UaG 218 ‘PY 34ET [UILY TTHOT Sunoeiiuol 1
00°09 5 O0'TEE'STZ § 00°0ZS¥T $ 00TT806T $  69/£9 OW 38piy YeQ ‘3 AemudiH 21815 06Z€ 51313.0U0) Ja81eqeuo.y
00°£9 $ 00'S86'96T $ OO'ETS'SE S 0OUYTIIT  $ 80Z€9 O ‘smisad ‘£€9 xog "0'd Bulaed 1519%0(
00'59 § BZPA0'RIT § 2T'ITR'6T S oT'skZ8PT S Lv/€9 OW ‘WIaypati4 ‘€Ty py Auno) 0142 Buiysiuld Juawa) addeq
sjuswwo) pigmol o) Jad apesdqgns peg |exol leudl|y ppy pid Ssalppy awep ssauisng
geoziveie

Juswaoe|dey 81910U0Y ‘1§ poomyied



Staff Report étc g o
” s A I/ [ -
February 24, 2022 y
1, Genevicve

Missouri

To:  Board of Aldermen : - ~—
From: Happy Welch
Re: 2022 Street Repaving Program

Issue:

Bid requests were sent out to 3 asphalt contractors with 3 responses for the bid opening on
Thursday, February 10, 2022. Those submitting bids were Jokerst Paving, Jokerst, Inc., and
Vern Bauman Contracting. Bids were advertised in the January 5 edition of The Herald. We
also walked the site with the contractors.

Bids were opened and read aloud at 10a. While reviewing the bids it was noted that Jokerst, Inc.
had not submitted a bid bond to guarantee the bid price at the opening. Bid paperwork notes that
a bid bond is required and I believe the Jokerst, Inc. bid is disqualified.

Recommendation:

Low bid based on the submitted paperwork is Vern Bauman Contracting at $190,705. That is
below our budget amount of $258,000 (with -$25,000 for the Cochran street review and
+$25,000 from the Special Road District for Little Rock Road).



0056229 S
00°LTL'ST S
00°ZEV'Y0T S

|euoiIppy 183png
elxy

je1ol palsdpng

X 00'S0L‘'06T S 0£9€9 'uaD "3)S ‘2€ AemysiH T/#TZ  Sunoesluo) uewneg UIdA

PIq Yum papnjaul puoq piq ON ST°'S88'SLT § 0/9€9 "uao "31s ‘z¢ AemysiH vvv9T "Ju) 1s1v01

00°LEV'VOT S 8Z0E9 O ‘sN1sa4 ‘€9 Xog 'O'd 3uined 154901

pig mo1 sSjuLaWWo) unowy pig Ssalppy awep ssauisng
cecoe/ve/e

weubouad Buineday 1900418 2202



BILL 4475 ORDINANCE

AN ORDINANCE OF THE STE. GENEVIEVE BOARD OF ALDERMEN
AUTHORIZING THE CITY ADMINISTRATOR TO UTILIZE COCHRAN
ENGINEERING FOR QUALITY CONTROL ON THE PARKWOOD DRIVE
CONCRETE REPLACEMENT PROJECT.

WHEREAS, the Ste. Genevieve Board of Aldermen (“Board™) approved the Parkwood Drive
Concrete project in the FY 2022 Budget; and

WHEREAS, the City of Ste. Genevieve (“City”) will need engineering services provided to
ensure quality materials and workmanship; and

WHEREAS, the City wishes to contract with Cochran Engineering to provide concrete testing,
aggregate testing and sampling/density testing for the Parkwood Drive Replacement Project; and

WHEREAS, Cochran will perform those duties on a time and material basis; and

WHEREAS, the Board believes it is in the best interests of the City to contract for testing
services for the Parkwood Replacement Project.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN OF
THE CITY OF STE. GENEVIEVE, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1: That the Board of Aldermen of the City of Ste. Genevieve, Missouri, hereby
authorizes the City Administrator, to contract with Cochran Engineering for quality control for
street repairs for the Parkwood Drive Replacement Project. (Exhibit “A”)

Section 2: That this ordinance shall become in effect immediately for the City of Ste.
Genevieve.

DATE OF FIRST READING:

DATE OF SECOND READING:

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS DAY OF » 20__ BY A ROLL
CALL VOTE OF THE STE. GENEVIEVE BOARD OF ALDERMEN AS FOLLOWS:




VOTE

ALDERWOMAN SUSAN JOHNSON

ALDERMAN GARY SMITH

ALDERMAN BOB DONOVAN

ALDERMAN MIKE JOKERST

ALDERMAN JEFF EYDMANN

ALDERMAN MIKE RANEY

ALDERWOMAN ASHLEY ARMBRUSTER

ALDERMAN JOE PRINCE

Yes No Absent
Approved as to form:

Paul Hassler, Mayor Mark Bishop, City Attorney
SEAL Reviewed by:

Pam Meyer, City Clerk Happy Welch, City Administrator



Exhibit "A"

OCHRAN

Architecture ® Civil Engineering ® Land Surveying e Site Development e Geotechnical Engineering ® Inspection & Materials Testing

Purchase Order

Date: 2-16-2022

City of Ste. Genevieve

To:
Project: Quality Control for Street Repairs
Location: Missouri

Dear Happy Welch :

We propose to provide the necessary labor and material to complete the following work, as requested.

SCOPE OF WORK:

1. Certified technician to perform the following work (as requested by contractor):

Concrete testing/concrete cylinders

Aggregate testing and sampling/density testing

2. Associated Lab Materials Testing

3. Administrative, Project Management, Coordination, Mileage and Drive time Associated with
Services

FEE:

Fees shall be billed hourly in accordance with the attached fee schedule.

Provided the above scope meets with your approval, please sign AND date below and initial the
bottom of the attached Cochran Terms and Conditions at your earliest convenience to allow us to
proceed with the Work.

The attached Cochran Standard Terms and Conditions shall apply to and govern this Work Order.

Acceptance:

Name: Date:

Signed: Email:

Title: Phone No.:
8 East Main Street 737 Rudder Road 530A East Independence Drive 1163 Maple Street 767 North 20th Street 905 Executive Drive
Wentzville, MO 63385 Fenton, MO 63026 Union, MO 63084 Farmington, MO 63640 Ozark, MO 65721 Osage Beach, MO 65065
Phone: 636-332-4574 Phone: 314-842-4033 Phone: 636-584-0540 Phone: 573-315-4810 Phone: 417-595-4108 Phone: 573-525-0299
Fax: 636-327-0760 Fax: 314-842-5957 Fax: 636-584-0512 Fax: 573-315-4811 Fax: 417-595-4109 Fax: 573-525-0298

www.cochraneng.com



OCHRAN

Architecture ® Civil Engineering ® Land Surveying e Site Development e Geotechnical Engineering ® Inspection & Materials Testing

2022
FEE SCHEDULE
LABORATORY TESTING
Test Method
Asphalt ASTM  AASHTO MoDOT Unit  Price
Asphalt Binder Content of Asphalt Mixtures by the Nuciear Method D4125 T 287 TM-54 each $100.00
Asphalt Binder Content of HMA by the lgnition Method D6307 T 308 each $150.00
Asphalt Binder Content of HMA with Washed Gradation - Ignition Method each $210.00
RAP or Aaaregate Correction Factor (for use with AC Content - Burn Off Method) TM-77  _each $125.00
Asphalt Calibration Curve for Nuclear Asphalt Content Gauge - 3 points each $300.00
Bulk Specific Gravity and Density of Non-Absorptive Compacted Bituminous Mixtures  D2726 T166 each $40.00
Thickness or Height of Compacted Bituminous Paving Mixture Specimens D3549 each $10.00
Concrete
Compressive Strength of Concrete Core (includes sawcutting one end) C39 T22 each 335.00
Compressive Strength of Concrete Cylinder (4"x8". 6"x12") €39 T22 each $15.00
Compressive Strenath of Grout (Prism or Cube) C1019 each  $20.00
Compressive Strenath of Mortar Cylinder (2"x4") C39 T22 each $15.00
Flexural Strength of Concrete Beam c78 197 each  $40.00
Sawcut Cylinders Ends (to meet ASTM standards) each  $15.00
Measuring Length of Drilled Concrete Cores C174 T 148 each  $25.00
Concrete Trial Mix Verification mix Er?c!lirggr
Soil
Atterberg Limits D4318 T 89/90 each  $85.00
California Bearing Ratio D1883 T193 each $180.00
Density of Soil in Place by the Drive-Cylinder Method D2937 each $35.00
Modified Proctor D1557 T 180 each $210.00
Moisture Content of Soil D2216 T265 each $20.00
pH Value G51 T 289 each  $40.00
Resistivity G187 T 288 each  $125.00
Standard Proctor D698 T99 each 3$180.00
Unconfined Compressive Strength of Cohesive Soil D2166 T208 each 3$75.00
Materials Finer than 75-um (No. 200) Sieve by Washing - Soit c117 T11 each _ $55.00
Initials:
8 East Main Street 737 Rudder Road 530A East Independence Drive 1163 Maple Street 767 North 20th Street 905 Executive Drive
Wentzville, MO 63385 Fenton, MO 63026 Union, MO 63084 Farmington, MO 63640 Ozark, MO 65721 Osage Beach, MO 65065
Phone: 636-332-4574 Phone: 314-842-4033 Phone: 636-584-0540 Phone: 573-315-4810 Phone: 417-595-4108 Phone: 573-525-0299
Fax: 636-327-0760 Fax: 314-842-5957 Fax: 636-584-0512 Fax: 573-315-4811 Fax: 417-595-4109 Fax: 573-525-0298

www.cochraneng.com



OCHRAN

Architecture e Civil Engineering ® Land Surveying e Site Development e Geotechnical Engineering ® Inspection & Materials Testing

LABORATORY TESTING

Test Method

Aggregates ASTM  AASHTO MoDOT Unit  Price
Deleterious Content of Aggreqate (Concrete, Asphalt and Base) TM-71  each $55.00
Flat and Elongated Particles in Coarse Aggregate D4791 each $55.00
Moisture Content of Agaregate C566 T255 each  $20.00
Specific Gravity and Absorption of Fine Aggreqgate €128 T84 each  $100.00
Specific Gravity and Absorption of Coarse Aggregate C127 T85 each  $65.00
Sieve Analysis of Fine and Coarse Aqaregates C136 T27 each  $65.00
Bulk Density ("Unit Weight') and Voids in Aggre g ate c29 T19 each  $40.00
Materials Finer than 75-um (No. 200) Sieve by W as hing -Agaregate C117 T11 each  $55.00
Rock
Compressive Strength of Rock Core C39 T22 each  $40.00
Rock Core Photograph each $2500
iti iel i
Rebound Hammer Test day  $25.00
Coring Bit Wear (Asphalt and Concrete) inch $6.00
Coring Equipment Rental dav  $75.00
Trailer for Curing Concrete Cylinders and Beams day $100.00
Nuclear Density Gauge day  $35.00
Measurement of Pavement Surface Texture Depth by the Sand-Patch Method TM-19 each $20.00
Cylinder Molds each  $1.00
Vapor Emissions each $17.50
Initials:
8 East Main Street 737 Rudder Road 530A East Independence Drive 1163 Maple Street 767 North 20th Street 905 Executive Drive
Wentzville, MO 63385 Fenton, MO 63026 Union, MO 63084 Farmington, MO 63640 Ozark, MO 65721 Osage Beach, MO 65065
Phone: 636-332-4574 Phone: 314-842-4033 Phone: 636-584-0540 Phone: 573-315-4810 Phone: 417-595-4108 Phone: 573-525-0299
Fax: 636-327-0760 Fax: 314-842-5957 Fax: 636-584-0512 Fax: 573-315-4811 Fax: 417-595-4109 Fax: 573-525-0298

www.cochraneng.com



OCHRAN

AT T B

Architecture o Civil Engineering ® Land Surveying e Site Development ® Geotechnical Engineering ® Inspection & Materials Testing

2022 Hourly Fee Schedule

The following is a list of hourly rates for our Fee Service Contracts.
Effective January 1, 2017, these rates will apply to all projects performed on a time and expense basis.

Title Charge-Out
Engineer 4 $ 95.00
Field Manager $ 75.00
Special Inspector $ 175.00
Administration $ 55.00
Engineering Technician $ 5500
MoDOT Certified Technician $ 60.00
Note:

*Survey Field crew prices will vary depending upon the Survey Tech assigned to the project.
*Overtime rate of 1.5 times the regular rate will be charged for hours worked after 8 hours per day, Saturdays,
Sundays, or Holidays.

8 East Main Street 737 Rudder Road 530A East Independence Drive 1163 Maple Street 767 North 20th Street 905 Executive Drive
Wentzville, MO 63385 Fenton, MO 63026 Union, MO 63084 Farmington, MO 63640 Ozark, MO 65721 Osage Beach, MO 65065
Phone: 636-332-4574 Phone: 314-842-4033 Phone: 636-584-0540 Phone: 573-315-4810 Phone: 417-595-4108 Phone: 573-525-0299
Fax: 636-327-0760 Fax: 314-842-5957 Fax: 636-584-0512 Fax: 573-315-4811 Fax: 417-595-4109 Fax: 573-525-0298

www .cochraneng.com



o

10.

I

13.

14.

15.

N D IT )

Unless expressly stated in the attached proposal letter (“Proposal™), the Proposal must be accepted in writing within thirty days or
the Proposal is void and unenforceable.

The acceptance of the Proposal is conditioned upon these Terms and Conditions and the terms of the Proposal, which shall be the
only terms and conditions applicable to any agreement between Cochran and Client. Requesting performance of the work by
Cochran, sending a notice to proceed with the work, or an acknowledgment of the Proposal by the issuance of a purchase order by
Client, notwithstanding any terms additional to or different from those contained herein, shall be deemed to be an acceptance of these
Terms and Conditions by Client.

The Proposal and these Terms and Conditions constitute the entire agreement (“Contract”) between Cochran and the Client for the
services identified in the Proposal. All prior proposals, negotiations, representations, recommendations, statements or agreements
made or entered into prior to or contemporaneously with this Contract, whether oral or in writing, are superseded by this Contract
unless they are expressly incorporated herein by reference. Any terms contained in any communication from Client which are
inconsistent with the Contract shall not be binding upon Cochran.

Cochran may submit invoices on not less than a monthly basis. Cochran’s invoices are due and payable within fifteen (15) days of
the submission of each invoice. Interest will accrue at the rate of one and one-half percent (1.5%) per month on all unpaid
invoices from the date payment was due. In the event that Client disputes an invoice, Client will pay the undisputed portion of the
invoice and provide a written explanation to Cochran of the basis for Client’s dispute. If Client fails to pay in full any of
Cochran’s invoices, Cochran may immediately, without waiving any other rights it may have, suspend work pending resolution of
the payment dispute. Client’s failure to pay any of Cochran’s invoices in full shall be considered a material breach of this
Contract.

Unless specifically stated to the contrary in the Proposal, reimbursable expenses are in addition to the amounts identified for
Cochran’s fees for basic and additional services. Reimbursable expenses shall include, but are not limited to: Client-authorized
out-of-town travel, transportation, and subsistence expenses; fees paid for securing approval of jurisdictional authorities; postage,
courier, or other delivery fees; material costs for models, mock-ups, or other presentation media; photographic film and development
expenses.

This Contract is binding upon the heirs, successors and assigns of the parties hereto and may not be assigned by either party
without the prior written consent of the other party.

Nothing in this Contract is intended to create any enforceable third party rights against Client or Cochran.

Cochran will perform all of its services consistent with that degree of skill and learning ordinarily used under the same or similar
circumstances by the members of Cochran’s profession working in the same locale.

If, and to the extent that Cochran’s scope of work includes construction phase services, any such services shall be provided in
accordance with and governed by the applicable terms of AIA Document A201 General Conditions of the Contract for Construction,
2007 Edition (“General Conditions™) If there is a conflict between the General Conditions and this Contract, this Contract will
control.

When making any interpretation or decision as required by the General Conditions, Cochran will not show partiality to any party,
and shall not be liable for interpretations or decisions rendered in good faith.

Cochran has no responsibility or obligation to supervise or direct the work activities of the Client’s employees and representatives,
or any construction contractors, sub-contractors or any of their employees, or other persons not employed by Cochran.

. Cochran will abide by any job-site safety programs identified in writing by the Client but will not be responsible for job-site safety

of any persons not directly employed by Cochran.

Cochran has no responsibility or obligation with respect to the construction means, methods, sequencing or procedures of any
construction contractors, sub-contractors or any of their employees.

Cochran is not responsible for the failure of any contractor to perform work properly and in accordance with any applicable
documents, plans, specifications, codes or standards.

Cochran is not responsible for the identification of unsafe conditions, nor for the identification, handling, or removal of hazardous
and/or toxic substances found on or brought to the site. Prior to the start of work, the Client shall disclose and identify in writing
to Cochran, to the best of Client’s knowledge, all hazardous and/or toxic substances located on the site. Client agrees to defend,
indemnify and hold Cochran harmless from and against all claims, demands and liabilities of any kind or nature resulting from any
hazardous and/or toxic substances that are found on the site and which were not identified by Client — even if not known by Client.

Initials



16.

17.

19.

20.

21.

Cochran will have no obligation to commence its work until receipt of a written notice-to-proceed from Client and all other information
required to be provided by Client. Cochran shall complete its work within any time limits identified in the Proposal. Cochran shall
be entitled to an extension of time for performance of its work due to any delays that are due to any cause beyond Cochran’s
reasonable control. In no event will Client be entitled to any costs, losses, expenses or damages (including, but not limited to,
claims or damages attributable to home office overhead costs, loss of profits, loss of business opportunities and/or additional financing
costs) as a result of any delay caused or attributable to Cochran.

Cochran and Client waive any and all claims against each other for consequential, indirect, incidental and special damages arising
out of or relating to this Contract, the alleged breach thereof, and/or Cochran’s work; including, but not limited to, lost profits, loss
of business, financing costs, extended home office overhead and similar types of damages.

. Provided that written notice of a material breach of this Contract has been provided to the defaulting party and the defaulting party

has failed to cure or taken reasonable efforts to cure its default within seven (7) calendar days of its receipt of the notice, the non-
defaulting party may terminate this Contract by sending notice of termination to the defaulting party.

If the Contract is terminated for any reason not attributable to Cochran, Client will pay for the work performed by Cochran up to
the date of termination plus all of Cochran’s costs related to the termination (e.g., close-out costs, costs of terminating contracts
with consultants, etc.).

In the event that there are any changes in applicable laws, codes or regulations after the Contract is executed that result in the need
for Cochran to perform additional services and/or incur additional costs, Client shall pay Cochran for said services and costs at the
rates set forth in the Proposal.

All documents and electronic media produced by Cochran under this Contract (“Instruments of Service”) shall remain the property
of Cochran, and Cochran shall retain all rights to the same, including copyrights, and they may be used by the Client only for the
project identified in the Proposal. In the event of the termination of this Contract, the Client shall return the Instruments of Service
to Cochran, and the Instruments of Service may not be used by the Client or a third party to complete the project without the
written consent of Cochran.

22. Client and Cochran waive all rights against each other, any contractors and other professionals, and any of their respective consultants,

contractors, suppliers, subcontractors, agents and employees, for damages caused by perils to the extent covered by insurance, except
such rights as they may have to the insurance proceeds.

. This Contract and the rights of the parties shall be governed by the laws of the State of Missouri.

. In the event of any dispute, claim, arbitration or litigation arising out of or relating to this Contract, the alleged breach thereof,

and/or Cochran’s work, the prevailing party shall be awarded its attorney’s fees, expert witness fees, expenses, arbitration fees and
expenses, and court costs at the trial and all appellate levels; including costs and fees related to collection efforts. Determination
of which party prevailed shall be made by the judge or arbitrator(s). The determination shall be made by reviewing the claims
resolved at trial or arbitration (which excludes any claims resolved prior to the taking of evidence), and then determining which party
achieved the greater success by quantifying the amounts awarded the party recovering damages or obtaining relief and comparing
that result to the relief and/or damages requested by that party at the trial or arbitration. If that party received less than

50% of the relief and/or damages it sought, then the other party prevailed. If that party receives more than 50% of the relief and/or
damages it sought, then it prevailed. The judge or arbitrator(s) may consider the percentage of recovery when determining the
amount of fees and expenses to be awarded to the prevailing party. If more than one claim is presented, then the judge or arbitrator(s)
may elect to evaluate who is the prevailing party on a claim by claim basis, or in the aggregate as they deem appropriate. “In making
the determination of which party prevailed, the judge or arbitrator(s) shall take into consideration any settlement offers or demands
made prior to trial or arbitration.

Updated 01/2016 Initials



BILL NO. 4476 ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF STE. GENEVIEVE AUTHORIZING FINAL PAYMENT TO
DONZE CONSTRUCTION, INC, FOR THE REMODEL OF THE CITY POLICE DEPARTMENT
& BASEMENT IN AN AMOUNT OF $48,876.20 AND APPOVING THE FINAL CONTRACT
PRICE OF $293,202.46.

WHEREAS, the City of Ste. Genevieve (“CITY”) contracted with Donze Construction, Inc. for
the “REMODEL OF CITY POLICE DEPARTMENT & BASEMENT”; and

WHEREAS, the Board accepted a bid proposal from Donze Construction, Inc. in the amount
0f $298,914.00; and

WHEREAS, the Board now wishes and believe it to be in the best interest of the City to
approve the change orders totaling -$5,711.54 and remit a final payment to Donze
Construction in the amount of $48,876.20 for Final Pay Request #4. (Exhibit “A”)

NOW THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN OF THE CITY OF
STE. GENEVIEVE, MISSOURI AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. The Board of Aldermen of the City of Ste. Genevieve, Missouri hereby accept
the latest application and certificate for payment submitted by Donze Construction, Inc. of
Ste. Genevieve, Missouri for the remodel of the City Police Department and Basement along
with the change orders totaling a credit of five thousand seven hundred eleven dollars and
fifty four cents ($5,711.54) and authorize a final payment in the amount of forty-eight
thousand eight hundred seventy-six dollars and twenty cents ($48,876.20), attached as
Exhibit “A”.

Section 2. The payment will be withdrawn from Police Department Fund line item 10-16-
8010.

SECTION 3. EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and
after its date of passage.

SECTION 4. REPEALER. All ordinance and parts thereof in conflict with this ordinance
are hereby repealed to the extent of such inconsistency.

DATE OF FIRST READING:

DATE OF SECOND READING:




ALDERMAN GARY SMITH
ALDERWOMAN SUSAN JOHNSON
ALDERMAN BOB DONOVAN
ALDERMAN MIKE JOKERST
ALDERMAN JEFF EYDMANN
ALDERMAN MICHAEL RANEY
ALDERWOMAN ASHLEY ARMBRUSTER
ALDERMAN JOE PRINCE

__YES _ NO__ABSENT

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Paul Hassler, Mayor Mark Bishop, City Attorney

ATTEST: REVIEWED BY:

Pam Meyer, City Clerk Happy Welch, City Administrator



llAll

Exhibit

"JORJUOD SIY} JopUN JOJOBIJUOD) JO JBUMQ BU}
Jo s)yBy Aue o) soipnlaid Jnoypm ase JuswAhed Jo souejdsdoe pue JuswAed ‘aouenss| "uldIsY pawWeU
0D ay) 0} Auo ajgeded si 314119TD INNOWY SYL "2|genobau Jou s| 8}eoyied siyl

(G'112°6) J18piQ 8bueyd Aq SIONVHO 13N
:e)ed Ag  [(96'822°2) Zv'/Z10'c [STvioL
103LHoNY  [(96'82/°7) UIUO siu} paaoidde [ejof
2102 1BUMQ Aq syjuow snoiaauid ul paaosdde sabueyo [ejo |
(‘palipIes Junowe oy} Yim wiojuod 0] pebugra e jey] 199y UCHENURUOD By} Uo pue Loleyddy SNOILONA3a | SNolLiaav AHVYWINS Y3AY0 TIONYHD
sy} uo saunby je fenup “peydde Junowre ayy L SYIP payie Junolwe Ji uojeuedxs yoepy)
Ly e qI1411439 AINNOWY
"PALINAY JUNoWy (9 aur7 sse| ¢ aury)
ay} jo wawdhed o} papRUS SI JOJOBHUOD B} PUB ‘SJUBLLNDOQ o8 8} yym souepiodde 1000 IDVNIVLIY ONIANTINI ‘HSINIA OL ADNVIVE 6
Ui st Y0 a4 jo Aljenb ay *pajeoipul se passauboud sey o ay3 jeiidepue uojewlolul  (0Z 928G 3NA INJWAVd INIHNND '8
.Omvm_\so:v_ SJ09NYIIY By) JO }s8q ay) 0} 1Y) JaumQ 8y} 03 saiiad Joa)Iydle ay) ‘uoiy Awumo_u_tmu hn___._n_ wol 9 wc_lc
Buisudiios ejep ayj pue SUOBAISSGO B}IS-UO UO PISE] 'SIUSUNO0Q JOBIIUOY U} YiIM SOUEPIOD 92'92E'vve ANIWAVd ¥Od SILYIIHILYID SNOIATM $ST1 2
LNIWAVC Y04 FLVIIILYTD S.LOTLIHOHY (|e1oL g eury ss&7  aurT)
heog :o € ‘wsa_z_me_%m — ovumom.mmm I9OVNIVLIY SSIT daNyv3 V10l "9
'sal| isswwod AN [00°0 (€049 Jo | uwn|o ul |ejo] o qg + eg saur) abeuleiay [B10L
\?Q\S\W)AS\G@Q :21/qnd ArejoN (€029 uo 4 uwnjog)
[BLIBJBIN PRIO)S 10 %, 'q
a2x #ohep ¢} sipow (0.9 uo 3+Q uwnjo))
2l0joq 0} UIOMS pue paquasqng NIoAA poledwod Jo %01 ‘e
N AR G - 949 10 Aunog FOVUNIVLIIN 'S
Jooleis  |9v'202's6e (€049 Uo © UWN|OD) 31vd OL AFHOLS 2 AILITdNOD TVLOL
‘Ag 91'202'€6¢ (22 L aur7) 31va OL WNS LOVHINOD ‘€
VHLNOD S LLL'G- s1apio sbueyg Aq abueys 1N -z
"8Np mouU si ujassy umoys JuswAhed usunojew (007 L6862 WNS LOVALINOD TVNISINO |}

Pue ‘JoumQ 8y} wol paAleda. sjuswAed pue panss] a1om JUSWABY 10} S8}EORILED) SNOIASId YoIym
Joj yu0 Joj Jojoenuo) ay Aq pled ussq sAeY SJUNOWE | JBUY} ‘SJUSINDO0Q JORJUCD ay) Ylim
S0UBpIOdJE U] paje|dwod usaq sey Jusiuked 1o} uohediddy siyy Aq PaISACD Yo BY) Jaljaq pue
uoniewwojul ‘sfpajmousy $,J0j0BI1JU0D BY} JO }S2q 8Y} 0} Jey) SaIULD Joypenuo) paubisispun ay |

psyoeye si ‘€09 uswnoo( V|Y '189Ys uojenupuod

“JOBNUOD BY) YIM UOROBUUOD Ul ‘MOJeg Umoys se ‘Juswied Joj apew si uopedijddy

ANIJNAVd 804 NOILVIITddV S.HOLOVILINOD

Leoe/eey ‘41VAd LOVHINOD

uondnAsuoy [eBUsY  HO4 LOVHINOD

0/9€9 OW ‘IATJININTD 318
1S @Y€ ‘N SS.

"ONI ‘NOILONYLSNOD 3ZNOd
*HOLOVILINOD WOYA

0/9€9 O IAIIAINID '31S

1S H1v HLNOS S91
2eoe/8Lie ‘0L dordad "1d3d 30110d ALID 13A0ONIY JATIAINAO '31S 40 ALID
IYNId - ¥ *ON NOILYOINddV 103rodd ‘U3INMO OL

juswihed 1o} ajeannta) pue uonesijddy

0.9 LNIINNDOA VIV




00°0$ %001 99°202'¢62% 00°0$ 02°9.8°8b$ 92'92E'ves 91°202'€67$
000 %001 (00°59Z'€) (00°'592'¢) (00'692'¢) 110350 TYLIN 1IIHS ANV 4008 Nad3-8# 00| 2€
000 %001 (96°0¢€1) (96°0¢1) (96°0€1) 110340 SNOILDFLONd TIVM - L# 02|  LE
000 %001 (00°029°¢) (00°029'€) (00°029'¢) 110340 IOVYNIS - 9# 00| 0F
000 %001 (0oeLs) (00°€LL) (00°€Ls) 1ia340 X08 XONX ? SH00d SS300V - 64 00| 62
000 %001 76'92¢ 26°92¢ 26'92¢ 3ISYIHONI LSOO SAMOSSIOOV Hive - v# 00| 82
000 %001 0528/ 05°28. 05°28/ ONITIVY HOAINHOD YOIMILNI - €4 00| /2
000 %001 00'€06 00'€06 00°€06 ONIYIM YHIWYD - L# 00| 92
000 %001 00°0SH'y 00°0SP'y 00°0S¥'v anod| Sz
000 %001 00'L¥0'0) 00°LpS'L 00'005'8 00°LY0°0l AvIHYIAO ® NOISIAYIANS "LSNOD IZNOQA| +2
00°0 %001 00000} 0005} 00°058 00°000°) 013 ‘HSVAL ‘137101 I1av1I¥0d| €2
000 %001 000826 000826 00°08.'6 SINO¥d I¥oLs| 22
000 %001 0062 12 06'Z98°01 05°298°01 00°6el'Le ONIgWN1d| 12
000 %001 00'L06'2¢ 01°690'C 06°GE8'0¢C 00°106'CE OVAH| 0¢
000 %001 00'GZL'EY 00'Sp.'8 00°086'vE 00'6zL'eh IOVLI0A MOT-TYDIdLOTT13| 61
000 %001 00'891°L 00891'1 00°89L°L S3NOSSIOOVY Hiva| 8l
000 %001 00°GSY 00°GSYy 00°6GY SNOILLO3LO¥d TIvYMm| /L
000 %001 00°08Z'y 00082y 00'082'v JOVYNIS| 9l
000 %001 00'GeL'pL 05°€0S"L 05'1E2'EL 00'GEL'vL ONILNIVd| Gl
000 %001 00°065'02 00PLL'8 00°9e¥'CL 0008502 ONIHOO1d| ¥l
00°0 %001 00°€L.s 00°€Ls 00'€LL XO8 XONY ¥ $400d $$300V| €1
000 %001 00°0€L'C) 00°0EL'ZL 00°0€L'C) IHVYMANYH 2 SINYYA 'SHO0A Tv.LIN MOTIOH| 2L
00°0 %001 00°006°2€ 00'006°2€ 00°006'.€ 1OV ‘NOILYINSNI ‘“TIvmAdal| LL
000 %001 00°000'GL 00°000'G1 00°000°GL ONITIZDO AAANIJSNS ® SANLS Tvlan| 0l
000 %001 00°00€'S 00°00€‘S 00°00€’S VL3N 133HS ANY 4004 Wad3| 6
000 %001 00'820°Z 90ezl't ¥6'0€ 00'820'C 013 ‘ST1IS T19UYN 2 HHOM 3SYD| 8
000 %001 00°052'61 00°0S2°0L 00°000'6 00°052'61 AYLNIJHVYO HSINIA| 2
000 %001 00'520'% 00'620'y 00'620'% SONITIvY| 9
000 %001 00°00S'€ 00'00S°E 00°00S'c OSIN 'ONINVYH OOM| &
000 %001 00°000'% 00°000'% 00°000"% AdNOSYN| ¥
000 %001 006006 00600'6 006006 MHOM JLIHONOD| €
000 %001 00°2€9'LL 0029’ L1 00°2E9'LL ¥31SdWNAa ® yoaviowaal z
000 %001 00°219'6 00°219'6 00°219'6 HOEVIONINVYL| |
(9-9) (3-9) (3+3+a) (2 40 NI LON) | NOILYDITddY |SNOILYOITddY ‘ON
HSINIJd OL % ALva 0L A3-0LS ?| STIVIMILYW SIHL SNOIATHd ANTIVA MHOM 40 NOILdI¥OS3a W31l
JONVIvE Qg3137dNOD TV.LOL a3xyols a3131dNOD MHOM a31Na3Hos alg
H 9 4 3 | a o) g v
¢2/8L/20 01 dold3ad
TZ/8L/20  F1VA NOILYDITddY T3IAOWIY "1d3A 30110d IAIIAINTD 31S :TWVYN 90r
¥ ‘ON NOILVYDITddY ININAVL HOd JLVIIJILHID ANV NOILYDI1ddY

S39Vd Z 40 z I9Vd 133HS NOILYNNILNOD




CHANGE ORDER

DONZE CONSTRUCTION, INC. DATE:
755 N. THIRD ST.
STE. GENEVIEVE MO 63670

2/8/2022

CITY OF STE. GENEVIEVE
65S.4TH ST
STE. GENEVIEVE, MO 63670

CHANGE ORDER #5

ACCESS DOORS & KNOX BOX CREDIT

CREDIT (713.00)

WE AGREE hereby to make the change(s) specified above at this price

DEDUCT

(713.00)

2/8/2022

Authorized Signature: James G. Donger  Acceptance:




CHANGE ORDER

DONZE CONSTRUCTION, INC. DATE: 2/8/2022
755 N. THIRD ST.
STE. GENEVIEVE MO 63670
CITY OF STE. GENEVIEVE
65S.4TH ST CHANGE ORDER #6
STE. GENEVIEVE, MO 63670
SINAGE CREDIT
AMOUNT IN BID 4,280.00
ACTUAL
MOON RIVER SIGNS 600.00
10% MATERIAL 60.00
ACTUAL TOTAL 660.00
CREDIT (3,620.00)
WE AGREE hereby to make the change(s) specified above at this price DEDUCT  (3,620.00)

2/8/2022

Authorized Signature: James G. Donges  Acceptance:




S MOUNTING STANDOFFS

INVOICE

Moon River Signs

John Pavlovits

4511 Niagara Dr, Saint Louis, MO 63129, UNITED STATES
Website: www.moonriverdivision10.com

Invoice No#: 848
Invoice Date: Dec 17, 2021
Due Date: Dec 17, 2021

ScahPay.Go

BILL TO

build@donzeconstruction.com

# ITEMS & DESCRIPTION

1 Mohawk 1000DA (Interior ADA signs)
Ste Genevieve Police Department Total of 6 signs Mohawk 1000DA
in 3279 Arch Grey with raised white letters

NOTES TO CUSTOMER

SHIP TO:

Donze Construction, Inc.
755 N. Third St.

Ste. Genevieve, MO 63670

QTY/HRS

6

Subtotal

TOTAL

Amount paid

AMOUNT DUE

Your order will be released into production immediately after we receive a receipt of payment.

Thank you very much for the opportunity to be of service to you.

TERMS AND CONDITIONS

Payment due upon receipt.

PRICE

$100.00

PAID

$0.00

AMOUNT DUE

AMOUNT($)

$600.00

$600.00

$600.00 USD

$600.00

$0.00 USD



CHANGE ORDER

DONZE CONSTRUCTION, INC. DATE: 2/8/2022
755 N. THIRD ST.
STE. GENEVIEVE MO 63670
CITY OF STE. GENEVIEVE
65S.4TH ST CHANGE ORDER #7
STE. GENEVIEVE, MO 63670
WALL PROTECTIONS CREDIT
AMOUNT IN BID 455.00
ACTUAL
INPRO CORP 294.58
10% MATERIAL 29.46
ACTUAL TOTAL 324.04
CREDIT (130.96)
WE AGREE hereby to make the change(s) specified above at this price DEDUCT (130.96)

2/8/2022

Authorized Signature: James G. Donger  Acceptance:




e INVOICE
ﬁ ' 0® Page 1of2
1 Invoice No. 2092778
\‘\’L—‘b " Invoice Date 01/04/2022
View and print your invoices. é ) \}\-ﬂ Customer No. 471355
Regqister at inprocorp.com Q b 43 F-O-B: FACTORY
Credit 262-682-5250
SOLD TO: SHIPTO: Fax: 262-679-5534
Donze Construction DONZE CONSTRUCTION
755 N 3rd St 755 N 3RD ST
Sainte Genevieve MO 63670 SAINTE GENEVIEVE MO 63670
United States United States
Federal 1D No.: 39-1455053
SHIP DATE SALES REP PURCHASE ORDER NO. SHIP VIA ORDER DATE " ORDER NO. TERMS
01/04/2022 Kristen Donze UPS Ground 12/02/2021 1634355 2% 10 Net 30 Days
ST ITEM NO/DESCRIPTION ;gfcrg AMOUNT
ORDERED SHIPPED BACK ORDERED
9 9 0 164 160 High-Impact Corner Guard 4' x 2", 90°

2% discount, if applicable, not available on
credit card payments and shipping charges.

To Pay By Credit Card, call 888-805-0019 or 262-682-5481

160 Surface Mount Corner Guard 4' x 2", 90° Castle

Notes

"VISA | [PSSVER
JU= ]

Pay online by credit card at:
inprocorp.com

Inpro

P.O.Box 720
Muskego, WI 53150




T T

INVOICE

' ' o Page 20f2
4 p ® invoice No. 2092778

Invoice Date 01/04/2022
View and print your invoices. Customer No. 471355
Register at inprocorp.com F.OB. FACTORY
' Credit 262-682-5250
SOLD TO:; SHIP TO: Fax: 262-679-5534
Donze Construction DONZE CONSTRUCTION
755 N 3rd St 755 N3RD ST
Sainte Genevieve MO 63670 SAINTE GENEVIEVE MO 63670
United States United States
Federal ID No.: 39-1455053
SHIP DATE SALES REP PURCHASE ORDER NO. SHIP VIA ORDER DATE ORDER NO. TERMS
01/04/2022 Kristen Donze UPS Ground 12/02/2021 1634355 2% 10 Net 30 Days
UANTITY
S ITEM NO/DESCRIPTION PURTcrE AMOUNT
ORDERED SHIPPED BACK ORDERED

_To Pay By Credit Card, call 888-805-001 9 or 262-682-5481

2% discount, if applicable, not available on
credit card payments and shipping charges.

Pay online by credit card at:
inprocorp.com

Special Instructions: Subtotal $243.72
Ste. Genevieve City Hall Corner Guards
Shipping Cost $35.69
Tax Total (%) $15.17
Inpro -
P.O. Box 720 Total $294.58

Muskego, Wi 53150




CHANGE ORDER

DONZE CONSTRUCTION, INC. DATE: 2/18/2022
755 N. THIRD ST.
STE. GENEVIEVE MO 63670
CITY OF STE. GENEVIEVE
65 S.4TH ST CHANGE ORDER #8
STE. GENEVIEVE, MO 63670
EPDM ROOF AND SHEET METAL CREDIT
EPDM ROOF NOT DONE - ONLY NEW GUTTER AND FASCIA
AMOUNT IN BID 5,300.00
ACTUAL

MEINERSHAGEN ROOFING 2,035.00

DIFFERENCE (3,265.00)

WE AGREE hereby to make the change(s) specified above at this price DEDUCT (3,265.00)

2/18/2022
Authorized Signature: James G. Donges  Acceptance:




